
 

 

The National Grid Electricity Transmission Plc (Grain to Tilbury) 
Compulsory Purchase Order 2024 

 
Compulsory Purchase of Land in Tilbury and Gravesend 

 

1. Notice is hereby given that National Grid Electricity Transmission Plc has made The National 

Grid Electricity Transmission Plc (Grain to Tilbury) Compulsory Purchase Order 2024 on 14th 

November 2024 under Section 10 of and Schedule 3 to The Electricity Act 1989. It is about to 

submit this order to the Secretary of State for Energy Security and Net Zero for confirmation, and 

if confirmed, the order will authorise National Grid Electricity Transmission Plc to purchase 

compulsorily the land and the new rights described below for the purpose of constructing a new 

cable tunnel under the River Thames between Tilbury and Gravesend to carry electricity cables, 

including two new sealing end compounds, two new tunnel headhouse buildings, new electric 

lines, gantry structures and temporary construction compounds  together with related apparatus, 

works and infrastructure to facilitate the transmission of electricity within and across the network, 

and to enable the decommissioning of existing electricity infrastructure. 

2. A copy of the order and of the accompanying maps may be seen at: Gravesend Library, Windmill 

Street, Gravesend DA12 1BE between: 10am and 5pm Monday – Saturday, or at One 

Community Development Trust, 134 Dock Rd, Tilbury RM18 7BJ - 9:30am and 5:30pm Monday 

– Thursday or 9.30am and 12.30pm on Friday. 

3. A copy of the order and accompanying maps, Statement of Reasons and documents referred to 

in the Statement of Reasons may be viewed online at: www.nationalgrid.com/electricity-

transmission/network-and-infrastructure/infrastructure-projects/grain-to-tilbury/document-library. 

4. Any objection to the order must be made in writing to the Secretary of State for Energy Security 

and Net Zero and submitted by e-mail to: annamaria.inglis@energysecurity.gov.uk or be sent 

by post marked for the attention of: Anna Maria Inglis, Department for Energy Security and Net 

Zero, Licensing and Consents Unit, 3 Whitehall Place, London SW1A 2AW before 20th 

December 2024 and should state the title of the order, the grounds of objection and the objector's 

address and interests in the land.  

Description of Land and New Rights 

LAND TO BE ACQUIRED 

Part of electricity substation site, part of private road, electricity pylon and overhead lines, north east of 
Substation Road and east of railway line, Thurrock; part of private road, scrubland, hardstanding, 
overhead lines and grass verge, south of electricity substation site and north of Ashfield Road, Thurrock; 
overhead lines, hardstanding, scrubland and grass verge, north of Ashfield Road and east of railway 
line, Thurrock; riverbank (River Thames), grassland and part of public footpath (KT NG 1 / Saxon Shore 
Way), north of electricity substation site and north west of Milton Rifle Range, Kent; grassland, and 
overhead lines, east of electricity substation site and west of Milton Rifle Range, Kent; part of electricity 
substation site, north of railway line and west of Milton Rifle Range, Kent; riverbank (River Thames), 
grassland and part of public footpath (KT NG 1 / Saxon Shore Way), north of electricity substation site 
and northeast of Metropolitan Police (Specialist Training Centre), Kent; electricity substation site, 
buildings, electricity pylons, overhead lines, hardstanding and access road, north of railway line and 
northeast of Metropolitan Police (Specialist Training Centre), Kent; access road, southwest of electricity 
substation site and north east of Metropolitan Police (Specialist Training Centre), Kent; grassland, 
wooded area, drain and part of access road, west of electricity substation site and northeast of 
Metropolitan Police (Specialist Training Centre), Kent; grassland, access road and drain, northeast of 
Metropolitan Police (Specialist Training Centre) and south of electricity substation site, Kent; grassland 
and drain, east of Metropolitan Police (Specialist Training Centre) and south of electricity substation site, 
Kent;  
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NEW RIGHTS TO BE ACQUIRED (The New Rights to be acquired are described in full in the 
order) 

Construction Access Rights in respect of land at:  

Scrubland, part hardstanding and part of electricity substation site, north of Substation Road and east of 
railway line, Thurrock; part of private roads (known as Substation Road and Ashfield Road), north of 
electricity substation site and east of railway line, Thurrock; part of private road (known as Substation 
Road) and hardstanding, south west of Ashfield Road and east of railway line, Thurrock; grass verge 
and footway, southeast of Wharf Road and north of railway line, Kent. 

Construction and Operational Access Rights in respect of land at: 

Part of private road (Ferry Road (A1089)), part of private road (known as Windrush Way), footway and 
grass verge, southeast of Macanie House and south of railway line, Thurrock; part of private road 
(Windrush Way), part of public footpath (TU 144), footway and grass verge, south of railway line and 
south of Brunel Close, Thurrock; part of private road (known as Windrush Way), footway and grass 
verge, south of railway line and south of Edinburgh Mews, Thurrock; part of private road (known as 
Windrush Way), footway and grass verge, south of railway line and south of Elizabeth Close, Thurrock; 
part of private road (Windrush Way), footway and grass verge, south of railway line and southwest of 
electricity substation site, Thurrock; part of private roads (known as Windrush Way and Substation 
Road) beneath but not including public adopted highway (Fort Road), roundabout, footway and grass 
verge, south of railway line and south of electricity substation site, Thurrock; part of private road (known 
as Substation Road), level crossing, footway and grass verge, southwest of electricity substation site 
and north west of Ashfield Road, Thurrock; part of private road (known as Substation Road), verge, 
overhead lines and grass verge, south of electricity substation site and east of railway line, Thurrock; 
part of private roads (known as Substation Road and Ashfield Road), hardstanding and grass verge, 
Thurrock; part of Milton Rifle Range, part of Milton Rifle Range access road, drain, bridge over drain and 
overhead lines, southeast of electricity substation and north of railway line, Kent; private road (known as 
Thames and Medway Canal Towpath), part of public footpath (KT NG 2), part of cycle pathway (National 
Cycle Network Route 1), grass verge, drain and scrubland, southeast of electricity substation site and 
north of railway line, Kent; part of private road (known as Thames and Medway Canal Towpath), part of 
public footpath (KT NG 2), part of cycle pathway (National Cycle Network Route 1); footway, grass verge 
and hedgerow, south of Metropolitan Police (Specialist Training Centre) and north of railway line, Kent; 
part of private road (known as Thames and Medway Canal Towpath), part of public footpath (KT NG 2), 
part of  cycle pathway (National Cycle Network Route 1), footway, grass verge, drain and hedgerow, 
north of railway line and south of electricity substation site, Kent; part of private road (known as Thames 
and Medway Canal Towpath), part of public footpath (KT NG 2), part of  cycle pathway (National Cycle 
Network Route 1), footway and grass verge, southeast of Wharf Road and north of railway line, Kent. 

Construction Compound Rights in respect of land at: 

Part of private road and grass verge, south of electricity substation site and north of Ashfield Road, 
Thurrock; grass verge and part hardstanding, north of electricity substation site and east of railway line, 
Thurrock; private road, grassland and hardstanding, northwest of electricity substation site and east of 
railway line, Thurrock; scrubland, hardstanding and grass verge, east of railway line and south of 
Ashfield Road, Thurrock; grassland and scrubland, southeast of electricity substation site and north of 
railway line, Kent; grassland and scrubland, east of Metropolitan Police (Specialist Training Centre) and 
south of electricity substation site, Kent; 

Decommissioning Overhead Lines Rights in respect of land at: 

Grassland, drain, overhead lines, track, part of Milton Rifle Range, part of Milton Rifle Range access 
road, bridge, overhead lines and electricity pylon, southeast of electricity substation site and north of 
railway line, Kent. 

 

 



 

Drainage Rights in respect of land at: 

Scrubland and drain, east of Substation Road and north of Ashfield Road, Thurrock; drain and 
scrubland, north of Ashfield Road and east of railway line, Thurrock; drain, southeast of electricity 
substation site and north of railway line, Kent; drain, northeast of Metropolitan Police (Specialist Training 
Centre) and south of electricity substation site, Kent. 

New Overhead Line Rights in respect of land at: 

Scrubland, electricity pylon, part hardstanding, drain and overhead lines, east of Substation Road and 
north of Ashfield Road, Thurrock; grassland, drain, part of Milton Rifle Range, part of Milton Rifle Range 
access road, bridge, overhead lines and electricity pylon, southeast of electricity substation site and 
north of railway line, Kent;  

Tunnel and Cable Rights and Tunnel Protection Rights in respect of land at: 

Drain and scrubland, north of Ashfield Road and east of railway line, Thurrock; scrubland, electricity 
pylon, overhead lines, and part of public footpath (TU 146), east of railway line and south of Ashfield 
Road, Thurrock; part of private road (known as Ashfield Road) and part scrubland, north of electricity 
substation and east of railway line, Thurrock; scrubland and drain, north of Ashfield Road and east of 
railway line, Thurrock; scrubland, grassland and part of public footpath (TU 146), east of railway line and 
northeast of electricity substation site, Thurrock; riverbed and bank (River Thames), scrubland and part 
of Thames Estuary Path and part of cycle pathway (National Cycle Network Route 13), southeast of 
Ashfield Road and east of electricity substation site, Thurrock; River Thames, riverbed and bank, 
southeast of Substation Road and southeast of Ashfield Road; River Thames and riverbed, southeast of 
railway line and southeast of electricity substation site, Thurrock; River Thames and riverbed, south of 
East Tilbury Jetty and east of map centre (567120E 175211N), Thurrock; River Thames, riverbank and 
riverbed, northwest of map centre (567393E 174642N), Thurrock and Kent; River Thames and riverbed, 
west of map centre (567393E 174642N), Kent; River Thames, riverbank and bed, north of electricity 
substation site and north west of Milton Rifle Range, Kent; River Thames, riverbank and bed, north of 
electricity substation site and north east of Metropolitan Police (Specialist Training Centre), Kent; 
grassland, drain and overhead lines, southeast of electricity substation site and north of railway line, 
Kent;  

Monitoring and Survey Access Rights in respect of land at: 

Part of private road (known as Ashfield Road), east of railway line and northeast of electricity substation 
site, Thurrock; part of splay, south of Ashfield Road and east of railway line, Thurrock; scrubland, part of 
public footpath (TU 146), track and part hardstanding, north of the River Thames and east of electricity 
substation site, Thurrock; scrubland, north of the River Thames and east of electricity substation site, 
Thurrock;     

Construction Compound Rights, Tunnel and Cable Rights and Tunnel Protection Rights in 
respect of land at: 

Scrubland, hardstanding, grass verge and overhead lines, north of Ashfield Road and east of railway 
line, Thurrock; hardstanding and grass verge, east of railway line and south of Ashfield Road, Thurrock;  

Construction Access Rights, Tunnel and Cable Rights and Tunnel Protection Rights in respect of 
land at: 

part of private road (known as Ashfield Road), part scrubland and overhead lines, north of electricity 
substation site and railway line, Thurrock;  

Monitoring and Survey Access Rights, Tunnel and Cable Rights and Tunnel Protection Rights in 
respect of land at: 

 

Part of private road (known as Ashfield Road), east of railway line and northeast of electricity substation 
site, Thurrock; private road, part of public footpath (TU 146) and scrubland south of Ashfield Road and 
east of railway line, Thurrock; scrubland, north of the River Thames and east of electricity substation 



 

site, Thurrock; riverbank (River Thames), grassland, metal railings, drain and part of public footpath (KT 
NG 1 / Saxon Shore Way), north east of electricity substation and north west of Milton Rifle Range, Kent; 
drain, grassland and part of Milton Rifle Range, northeast of east of electricity substation site and north 
of railway line, Kent; grassland, track and drain and part of Milton Rifle Range, east of electricity 
substation site and north of railway line, Kent. 

 

Dated: 21st November 2024 

Signed: 

  

Steve Lam 

Project Director 

National Grid 

 

 

 

 

 


